
City of Wasco City Council Meeting Agenda, November 15, 2022

. 

Pursuant to the Governor's Executive Order N-08-21, the City Council Members and 
staff may choose to participate in person or by video conference. The City Council 
meetings are presented in a hybrid format, both in-person at City Hall and virtually via 
Zoom Webinar. The public may participate via the following options: 

1. Attending in person: All attendees are encouraged to wear a face-covering at 
all times while in the Council Chambers or City Hall. Please maximize spacing by 
utilizing all seating in the Chambers.

2. Members of the public can view the City Council meetings live on the city’s 
website: https://www.cityofwasco.org/306/city-council-meeting-videos, 

3. Public comments regarding matters on the agenda may be made in person or 
via email. If you wish to comment on a specific agenda item, submit your 
comment via email to cityclerk@cityofwasco.org  no later than 4:00 p.m.
November 15, 2022. Please clearly indicate which agenda item number your 
comment pertains to. If you wish to make a general public comment unrelated 
to a specific agenda item, submit your comment via email to 
cityclerk@cityofwasco.org  no later than 4:00 p.m. November 15, 2022. 

Every effort will be made to read your comment into the record; however, they are 
limited to two (2) minutes. If a comment is received after the specific time mentioned 
above but before the meeting is adjourned, the comment will still be included as a part 
of the record of the meeting but will not be read into the record.

REGULAR MEETING – 6:00 pm

1) CALL TO ORDER: Mayor Reyna

2) ROLL CALL: Mayor Reyna, Mayor Pro Tem Pallares, Council Members: Garcia, Lynch,
Martinez

3) FLAG SALUTE: by Johnny Enciso, son of Denise and Oscar Enciso

4) INVOCATION: by Paul Hernandez, Free Will Baptist Church

AGENDA
Regular City Council Meeting,
Successor Agency to the 
Former Redevelopment Agency and the
Wasco Public Finance Authority
Tuesday, November 15, 2022 – 6:00 pm.
Council Chambers 
746 8th Street, Wasco, CA 93280
www.cityofwasco.org

...........

1 of 79



City of Wasco City Council Meeting Agenda, November 15, 2022

5) PRESENTATIONS:
a. Recognition for Planning Commissioner David Ward

6) PUBLIC COMMENTS:
This portion of the meeting is reserved for persons desiring to address the Council and
including the Council acting as the Governing Board for the Successor Agency on any
matter not on this agenda and over which the Council and Successor Agency have
jurisdiction. Speakers are limited to two (2) minutes. A maximum of Thirty (30) minutes will
be allowed for any one subject. Please state your name for the record before making
your presentation.

BROWN ACT REQUIREMENTS: The Brown Act does not allow action or Discussion on items
not on the agenda (subject to narrow exceptions). This will limit a Councilmember’s
response to questions and requests made during this comment period.

7) SUCCESSOR AGENCY BUSINESS: NONE

8) WASCO PUBLIC FINANCE AUTHORITY BUSINESS: NONE

CITY COUNCIL BUSINESS: 
9) CONSENT CALENDAR:

The Consent Calendar consists of items that, in the staff's opinion, are routine and non-
controversial. These items are approved in one motion unless a Council Member or
member of the public requests the removal of a particular item.

a. Receive and file department payments totaling $1,526,309.07

b. Adopt a Resolution to Authorize the City to Implement Teleconference Public
Meetings Pursuant to Assembly Bill (“AB”) 361, Allowing the City to Continue a
Hybrid Virtual Meeting Environment.

c. Adopt a Resolution Authorizing the City Manager or his designee to approve a
purchase order in an amount not to exceed $110,314.05 for one Utility Crane Truck
for the Wastewater Department from National Fleet Group.

d. Adopt a Resolution Authorizing the City Manager or his designee to approve a
purchase order in an amount not to exceed $110,314.05 for one Utility Crane Truck
for the Water Department from National Fleet Group.

e. Adopt a Resolution to approve a Budget Amendment to Re-Allocate Funds to Pay
Retention for the 2021 Ag Well Project #30400-52040-20220 located at the SW
corner of Scofield & Dirt Poso 1 mile south of Highway 46.

f. Adopt a Resolution Authorizing the City Manager or his designee to approve a
purchase order with Ferguson Waterworks in the amount not to exceed $48,000.00
to purchase one hundred and fifty residential water meters.

g. Rejection of all bids received for 16th Street Rehabilitation Project.

2 of 79



City of Wasco City Council Meeting Agenda, November 15, 2022

10)PUBLIC HEARINGS:
a. Introduce and Waive the First Reading of an Ordinance of the City Council of the 

City of Wasco Repealing and Re-enacting Chapter 15.04 of the City of Wasco 
Municipal Code Relating to Building Code Regulations, and Adopting by 
Reference the California Code of Regulations Title 24, Parts 1-6 and 8-12, 2022 
Edition of the California Building Standards Code. (Cobb) 

b. Introduce and Waive the First Reading of an Ordinance of the City Council of the 
City of Wasco Repealing and Re-enacting Chapter 15.08 of the City of Wasco 
Municipal Code Relating to Fire Prevention Regulations and Adopting by 
Reference the California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 9, 2022 Edition of the 
California Building Standards Code. (Cobb)

11)DEFERRED BUSINESS: None

12)NEW BUSINESS: None

13)REPORTS FROM COMMISSIONS AND COMMITTEES:
a. Kern Economic Development Corporation (Garcia) 

b. Kern Council of Government (Reyna) 

c. Wasco Task Force (Martinez & Reyna)

14)REPORTS FROM KC FIRE AND SHERIFF: 
a. Kern County Fire Department (Appleton)

b. Kern County Sheriff’s Department (Shinn)

15)REPORTS FROM THE CITY MANAGER: 

16)REPORTS FROM THE CITY COUNCIL: 

17)CLOSED SESSION: 
a. PUBLIC EMPLOYEE APPOINTMENT per GC SECTION 54957

Title: Chief of Police

18)CLOSED SESSION ACTION: 

19)ADJOURNMENT: 

This is to certify that this agenda was posted at Wasco City Hall on November 10, 2022, 
on/or before 6:00 p.m. The agenda is also available on the City website at
www.cityofwasco.org.    

______________________________________ 
Maria O. Martinez, City Clerk

All agenda item supporting documentation is available for public review on the city website 
www.cityofwasco.org and the office of the City Clerk of the City of Wasco, 746 8th Street, Wasco, CA  93280, 
during regular business hours, 7:30 am – 5:00 pm Monday through Thursday and 8–5 pm Friday (closed alternate 

3 of 79

________
O. Mart



City of Wasco City Council Meeting Agenda, November 15, 2022 

Friday's), following the posting of the agenda. Any supporting documentation related to an agenda item for an 
open session of any regular meeting that is distributed after the agenda is posted and prior to the meeting will 
also be available for review at the same location and available at the meeting. Please remember to turn off all 
cell phones, pagers, or electronic devices during Council meetings. 
 
The City of Wasco does not discriminate on the basis of disability in the access to, provision of, or employment in 
its programs and activities pursuant to 29 United States Code Section 12132 and California Civil Code Section 54. 
Information regarding the rights provided under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may be obtained from 
the City Clerk's Office. 
 
If you need special assistance to participate in this meeting, please contact the City Clerk's Office at (661) 758-
7215 to make reasonable arrangements to ensure accessibility to this meeting. Telephone (661) 758-7215. 
Requests for assistance should be made at least two (2) days in advance whenever possible. 

4 of 79



WARRANTS AMOUNTS
G102622 1,314,585.35
A102622 16,534.84
G100222 19,756.25
G102422 73,463.85
A110222 56,141.46
G110222 37,849.32
G103122 7,978.00 Verified By:
Grand Total 1,526,309.07 Finance Director

A B C D E F G

WARRANT VENDOR NAME VENDOR No. INVOICE No. CHECK No. DESCRIPTION AMOUNTS
1 G102622 PG & E COMPANY 85 20533184923 10/12/22 24297 UB SW SESE 11 27 24 N/S POSO.25M W/O PALM10/12/22 15,643.29
2 G102622 PG & E COMPANY 85 58161952393 10/11/22 24297 UB MCCOMBS &GRIFFITH SE COR WATER WELL#12 10/11/22 5,039.81
3 G102622 PG & E COMPANY 85 07051823859 10/18/22 24297 UB 501 F ST 09/19/22 963.63
4 G102622 PG & E COMPANY 85 83658717562 10/14/22 24297 UB ANNEX PARKING LIGHT 10/14/22 12.16
5 G102622 PG & E COMPANY 85 51997041895 10/19/22 24297 UB 10/19/22 MULTIPLE LOCATIONS 39,350.33
6 G102622 ADMINISTRATIVE SOLUTIONS-FRESNO 2208 A1027219 24276 OCT 22: MEDICAL ADMIN FEES 1,430.00
7 G102622 UNIVERSAL URGENT CARE & OCCUPATIONAL MEDICINE INC 5268 EM013000 24304 PHYSICAL POST-OFFER 10/13/22 45.00
8 G102622 COUNTRY AUTO & TRUCK, INC. 3008 737837 24283 STREETS #78: STEP BARS 316.62
9 G102622 COUNTRY AUTO & TRUCK, INC. 3008 737851 24283 ANIMAL CONTROL #33: BATTERY, PRESSURE, TERMINAL 481.50
10 G102622 AFFINITY TRUCK CENTER 405 F013253983:01 24277 DISPOSAL #13: RECEIVER DRYER 37.08
11 G102622 AFFINITY TRUCK CENTER 405 F013253983:02 24277 DISPOSAL #13: EVAPORATOR 300.69
12 G102622 AFFINITY TRUCK CENTER 405 F013253984:01 24277 DISPOSAL #21: KNOBS 2 QT 19.23
13 G102622 KERN COUNTY WASTE MANAGEMENT DEPT. 19 LANDFILL OCT 2022 24293 OCT 2022: LANDFILL FEES 16,911.33
14 G102622 ACC BUSINESS 4766 222889873 24275 OCT 2022: FIBER NETWORK SERVICES 816.91
15 G102622 AFLAC 108 263671 24278 OCT 2022: AFLAC SERVICES 601.62
16 G102622 ANTONIO PACHECO 5830 16850-0360014440 24279 RFND CUST STOPPED SRVC 1444 POSO DR 21.76
17 G102622 ARNOLD KAMERON 5804 REIMB 10/14/22 24280 REIMB VEHICLE LICENSE PLATE AT DMV 23.00
18 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966804 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 28.47
19 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966805 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 46.60
20 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966806 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
21 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966807 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 327.64
22 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966808 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
23 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966809 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 69.06
24 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966810 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.15
25 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966811 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 46.60
26 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966812 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
27 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966813 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
28 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966814 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 1,290.81
29 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966815 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
30 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966816 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 28.47
31 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966817 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 44.92
32 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966818 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
33 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966819 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
34 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966820 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
35 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966821 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 24.14
36 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018966822 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 69.06
37 G102622 ATT - PAYMENT CENTER 1488 000018968346 24281 PHONE SERVICES 09/24/22-10/23/22 87.08
38 G102622 CITY OF WASCO/PUBLIC TRANSIT 1683 10267 24282 SEPT 2022:CNG FUEL-SANITATION 4,231.27
39 G102622 CUMMINS INC 376 X5-95013 24284 DISPOSAL #14: TUBE, TUR OIL SUPPLY 109.51

Council meeting: November 15, 2022

Bill Pay

1 of 3

Digitally signed by: 
Isarel Perez-Hernandez
DN: CN = Isarel Perez-
Hernandez email = 
isperez@cityofwasco.
org C = US
Date: 2022.11.07 18:
04:56 -08'00'

Isarel
Perez-
Hernande
z

5 of 79



A B C D E F G

WARRANT VENDOR NAME VENDOR No. INVOICE No. CHECK No. DESCRIPTION AMOUNTS
40 G102622 CUMMINS INC 376 Y8-27861 24284 WELL #12: MCCOMBS GENSET BATTERY CHARGER REPLACE 2,153.20
41 G102622 DEPARTMENT OF CONSERVATION 273 SMI FEES JUL-AUG 22 24285 JUL-SEPT 2022: SMI FEES 1,740.62
42 G102622 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32081 24286 23016 HARD PURCHASE-PRJ#23016 3 NETWORKS SWITCHES 7,771.68
43 G102622 FED EX 123 7-921-31104 24287 FREIGHT SERVICES 10/20/22 77.42
44 G102622 FERGUSON ENTERPRISES INC 1008 1749161 24288 WARF HEAD FIRE HYDRANT ON POSO BETWEEN E & F ST 1,005.32
45 G102622 INFO SEND, INC. 4244 222833 24289 2022 3rd QTR TCP ENG/SPA 834.74
46 G102622 IRMA LETICIA OLIVAS PONCE 5831 17372-0200009430 24290 RFND CUST STOPPED SRVC 960 E ST 80.50
47 G102622 KERN COUNTY FIRE DEPT. & OFFICE OF 1264 23-000099 24291 FY 22/23 2ND QTR AGRMNT#602-2021 141,097.50
48 G102622 KERN COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE 220 8943 24292 Q1 4FY 22/23 LAW ENFORCEMENT 1,056,917.75
49 G102622 LEDEZMA, MARTIN 5674 REIMB OCT 22 24294 REIMB TRAVEL TRAINING 61.00
50 G102622 NEW YORK LIFE INSURANCE COMPANY 4733 S10763 OCT 22 24295 OCT 2022: INS. PREMIUM 270.00
51 G102622 P & J ELECTRIC, INC. 66 7918 24296 CENTRIFUGE WELL #B LOW LEVEL ALERT & REPAIRS 1,444.15
52 G102622 PHOENIX GROUP INFORMATION SYSTEMS 4913 092022239 24298 SEPT 22:CITATIONS FEES&SRVCS PRE-INTERCEPT LETTERS 1,314.70
53 G102622 READYREFRESH BY NESTLE 4027 22J0018613430 24299 9/15/22-10/14/22: 5410 7TH ST & GWWTR SERVICE 168.11
54 G102622 ROBERT HALF 4814 60842893 24300 TEMP E. RAMIREZ WE 09/30/22 1,141.93
55 G102622 ROBERT HALF 4814 609828492 24300 TEMP E. RAMIREZ 10/14/22 1,357.50
56 G102622 SCHROETER, THOMAS F. 2732 SEPT 2022 24301 SEPT 2022: LEGAL SERVICES 6,807.50
57 G102622 STATEWIDE TRAFFIC SAFETY AND SIGNS INC 5700 12016750 24302 SIGN POSTS ANCHORS 1,478.12
58 G102622 THE GAS COMPANY 246 08207136329 OCT 22 24303 MULTIPLE ADDRESS FOR 09/13/22-10/12/22 228.75
59 G102622 Total 1,314,585.35
60 A102622 ADMINISTRATIVE SOLUTIONS-FRESNO 2208 10/17/22 5238 MEDICAL CHECK RUN 10/17/22 9,412.39
61 A102622 METROPOLITAN LIFE INSURANCE COMPANY 4932 TS05954057 NOV 22 5239 NOV 22: INS. PREMIUM 7,122.45
62 A102622 Total 16,534.84
63 G100222 CUMMINS INC 376 Y8-25098 24271 DISPOSAL #13: CONNECTION WATER OUTLET & PARTS 123.56
64 G100222 INFO SEND, INC. 4244 209538 24272 WATERBOARD PROGRAM-RUSH-WATER DEPT 807.47
65 G100222 INFO SEND, INC. 4244 204957 24305 12/31/21 STMT DATA PROCESSING/MAIL/PREP SRVCS 5,955.50
66 G100222 NAGLE EARTHWORKS 5002 3020-R 24273 19191 RETENTION:PALM AVE & MARGALO ST IMPROVEMENTS 3,593.03
67 G100222 NAGLE EARTHWORKS 5002 3044-R 24273 19191 RETENTION:PALM AVE & MARGALO ST IMPROVEMENTS 303.99
68 G100222 NAGLE EARTHWORKS 5002 3080-R 24273 19191 RETENTION:PALM AVE & MARGALO ST IMPROVEMENTS 3,123.93
69 G100222 TERRY EQUIPMENT INC 5785 ARINV124985 24274 DISPOSAL #25: FLIGHT ELEVATOR BELT AND SQUEEGEE 5,783.82
70 G100222 WASCO T-SHIRTS PRINTING 497 8252 24306 3 EMBROIDERED LOGO CUST SHIRTS & LOGO NAME-R.VILLARREAL 64.95
71 G100222 Total 19,756.25
72 G102422 JEFFRIES BROS., INC 140 114589 24267 PUMP OIL 55 GAL DRUM 416.76
73 G102422 SANDOVAL INDUSTRIES LLC 1180 3950 24269 OXYGEN TANK FOR TORCHES TO REPAIR METAL BINS 23.15
74 G102422 CUMMINS INC 376 Y8-27415 24264 CENTRAL & MARGALO INJECTOR PUMP REPAIRS 579.21
75 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 31928SC 24265 Monthly Sept 2022 IT Managed Services Agreement 2,811.33
76 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 31996 24265 Agreement BackupCentric-Unmanaged for Sept 2022 1,256.94
77 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32010 24265 21001 Destroy Azure VM And Backup Storage 127.50
78 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32011 24265 M365 Hardening 1,812.50
79 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32012 24265 Local Admin Rights for Sergio 522.50
80 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32013 24265 Mitel MiCollab Cannot connect to the server 617.50
81 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32014 24265 Bi-Monthly Maintenance - Server 1,275.00
82 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32015 24265 Access to a site 145.00
83 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32016 24265 Proofpoint 425.00
84 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32017 24265 Mitel / WatchGuard not working 237.50
85 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32018 24265 Missing Protections (Breach Detection)-COW 145.00
86 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32019 24265 21001 Microsoft Server Operating System Upgrade 3,720.00
87 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32049 24265 Mitel Conference Phones 95.00
88 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32051 24265 23016 City of Wasco Network Switch-Animal Control 1,045.00
89 G102422 DIAMOND TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 2724 32059 24265 make sure the PII emails are working as expected 108.75
90 G102422 INFO SEND, INC. 4244 221942 24266 09/01/22 STMTS,DATA,PRCSSNG,/PRINT/MAIL PREP SRVC 3,293.53
91 G102422 KNIGHT'S PUMPING & PORTABLE SERVICE, INC 1075 0000143261 24268 9/20/22-10/17/22:PORTABLE TOILET SERVICE @ GW SITE 74.68
92 G102422 SIEMENS INDUSTRY, INC. 4624 5330573132 24270 YEAR 4: PERFORMANCE ASSURANCE PROGRAM PMT SCHEDULE 8,935.00
93 G102422 SIEMENS INDUSTRY, INC. 4624 5530573133 24270 YEAR 4: MAINTENANCE SERVICE PAYMENT SCHEDULE 45,797.00
94 G102422 Total 73,463.85
95 A110222 ADMINISTRATIVE SOLUTIONS-FRESNO 2208 10/24/22 5241 MEDICAL CHECK RUN 10/24/22 5,783.98
96 A110222 BLUE SHIELD OF CALIFORNIA 3591 222870034021 5242 NOV 2022: INS. PREMIUM 50,357.48
97 A110222 Total 56,141.46
98 G110222 PG & E COMPANY 85 0008142171-1 24320 UB NW NE SE 92724 SOLAR PLANT-ANIMAL CONTROL OCT22 42.66

2 of 3
6 of 79



A B C D E F G

WARRANT VENDOR NAME VENDOR No. INVOICE No. CHECK No. DESCRIPTION AMOUNTS
99 G110222 PG & E COMPANY 85 46754368564 10/26/22 24320 UB NE COR CENTRAL AVE & MARGALO ST 10/26/22 124.72
100 G110222 AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES, INC 4968 1LWV-Q1KC-FHLW 24309 200 PAIRS EAR PLUGS-BUILDING & NOTE PADS & NOTEBOOKS-PLANNING 44.66
101 G110222 GARDAWORLD 4266 10714763 24316 NOV 2022: ARMORED CAR SRVCS 443.31
102 G110222 CHARTER COMMUNICATIONS 68 167736001102122 24313 OCT 2022: INTERNET SRVCS FOR CITY OF WASCO 226.68
103 G110222 THE SHAFTER PRESS/ WASCO TRIBUNE 4787 2681 24324 ADS:BUILDING CODE ADOPTING 96.00
104 G110222 FED EX 123 7-928-60053 24315 FREIGHT 10/27/22 74.17
105 G110222 SCHROETER, THOMAS F. 2732 OCT 2022 24323 OCT 2022: LEGAL SERVICES 4,891.25
106 G110222 ADVANTAGE ANSWERING PLUS 2564 123-4998-031 24308 NOV 2022: ANSWERING SERVICES 592.24
107 G110222 AMERICAN REFUSE INC 183 253608 24310 NOV 2022:RECYCLE @764 E ST 104.10
108 G110222 BADAWI & ASSOCIATES 5675 1286 24311 FY 2022 AUDIT PROGRESS BILLING #2 18,488.25
109 G110222 CANYON HILLS 5691 RECEIPTS #22-000767 24312 RFND BLOCK PARTY DEPOSIT 1 BARRICADES 220.00
110 G110222 CINTAS CORPORATION NO. 3 4480 4134373412 24314 UNIFORM SERVICES 10/14/22 260.56
111 G110222 CINTAS CORPORATION NO. 3 4480 4135070919 24314 UNIFORM SERVICES 10/21/22 262.23
112 G110222 GENERAL OFFICE MACHINE COMPANY 1195 19725 24317 PLANNING ANNUAL MAINT CONTRACT 12/05/22-12/04/23 238.15
113 G110222 GENERAL OFFICE MACHINE COMPANY 1195 19726 24317 FINANCE ANNUAL MAINT CONTRACT 12/05/22-12/04/23 535.84
114 G110222 NAVIA BENEFIT SOLUTIONS 5664 10530238 24318 OCT 2022: 9 PARTICIPANT FREE 54.00
115 G110222 NORTHWEST METROLOGY 5821 517883 24319 MASS FLOW METER & TEMP TRANSMITTER FOR COMPLIANCE 8,963.10
116 G110222 RICHARDS, WATSON, GERSHON A PROFFESSIONAL CORP 3343 239418 24321 SEPT 2022: LEGAL SERVICES 1,987.40
117 G110222 SANCHEZ MARIANA 5792 10/27/22 24322 OCT 2022: INTERPRETING SERVICES 200.00
118 G110222 Total 37,849.32
119 G103122 BHT ENGINEERING, INC 5134 22-490 24307 21036: CENTRAL & FILBURN WIDENING CONNECTION PRJ 725.00
120 G103122 BHT ENGINEERING, INC 5134 22-491 24307 21014 CMAQ PALM AVE 9/1/22 TO 9/30/22 JOB#22801 4,758.00
121 G103122 BHT ENGINEERING, INC 5134 22-492 24307 HSIP CYCLE 11 APPLICATION 9/1/22 TO 9/30/22 1,835.00
122 G103122 BHT ENGINEERING, INC 5134 22-493 24307 2022 MS4 ASSISTANCE: 9/1/22 TO 9/30/22 660.00
123 G103122 Total 7,978.00
124 GRAND TOTAL 1,526,309.07

3 of 3
7 of 79



. 

TO:    Honorable Mayor and Council Members
  
FROM:  M. Scott Hurlbert, City Manager
  Maria O. Martinez, City Clerk

DATE:    November 15, 2022

SUBJECT:  Adopt a Resolution to Authorize the City to Implement Teleconference 
Public Meetings Pursuant to Assembly Bill (“AB”) 361, Allowing the City to 
Continue a Hybrid Virtual Meeting Environment. 

Recommendation:  
Staff recommends authorizing the City to implement teleconference public meetings 
pursuant to Assembly Bill AB 361, allowing the City to continue a hybrid virtual meeting 
environment. 

Background: 
Over the past year, meetings of the City’s legislative bodies have been held with virtual 
teleconference components. On September 16, 2021, Governor Newsom signed 
Assembly Bill (“AB”) 361, which allows cities to continue to meet remotely during 
proclaimed states of emergency under modified Ralph M. Brown Act requirements that 
are similar but not identical to the rules and procedures established by the previous 
Executive Orders temporarily suspending provisions of the Brown Act. On September 20, 
2021, Governor Newsom signed Executive Order N-15-21 to suspend AB 361 until October 
1, 2021. 

AB 361, until January 1, 2024, would authorize a local agency to use teleconferencing 
without complying with the teleconferencing requirements imposed by the Brown Act 
when a local legislative body holds a meeting during a declared state of emergency by 
the Governor and when a state or local health officials have imposed or recommended 
measures to promote social distancing.

Discussion:
On June 11, 2021, Governor Newsom issued Executive Order N-08-21, which among other 
things, rescinded his prior Executive Order N-29-20 and set a date of October 1, 2021, for 
public agencies to transition back to public meetings held in full compliance with the 
Brown Act.

As the virus continues to periodically surge in California, the goal of AB 361 is “to improve 
and enhance public access to local agency meetings during the COVID-19 pandemic 

STAFF REPORT
City of Wasco

.............

8 of 79



and future applicable emergencies by allowing broader access through 
teleconferencing options,” consistent with Executive Order N-29-20. AB 361 contains an 
urgency clause which became effective upon signing with a sunset of January 1, 2024.  
AB 361 also provides that if a local agency conducts teleconference meetings in reliance 
on AB 361, the local agency must make the following findings by majority vote every 30 
days to continue using the bill’s exemption to the Brown Act teleconferencing rules: 
 

 The legislative body has reconsidered the circumstances of the emergency, and 
 

 Either of the following circumstances exists: The state of emergency continues to 
directly impact the ability of members to meet safely in person, or State or local 
officials continue to impose or recommend social distancing measures. 

 
Staff recommends adopting the resolution to authorize the implementation of 
teleconferencing public meetings. 
 
Fiscal Impact:   
None 
 
Attachments:  

1. Resolution 
 

9 of 79



 
 

                                                  RESOLUTION NO. 2022 -  
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WASCO TO IMPLEMENT 
TELECONFERENCING REQUIREMENTS DURING A PROCLAIMED  STATE OF EMERGENCY 

FOR ALL CITY COUNCIL, COMMITTEE, COMMISSION, BOARD, AND OTHER CITY 
MEETINGS PURSUANT TO ASSEMBLY BILL 361 

 
WHEREAS, the Ralph M. Brown Act (“Act”) requires that all meetings of a 

legislative body of a local agency be open and public and that any person may 
attend and participate in such meetings; and 
 

WHEREAS, the Brown Act allows for legislative bodies to hold meetings by 
teleconference but imposes specific requirements for doing so; and 
 

WHEREAS, on March 4, 2020, the Governor issued a proclamation declaring a 
state of emergency due to the COVID-19 pandemic pursuant to Government Code 
8625, and this proclaimed state of emergency currently remains in effect; and 
 

WHEREAS, on March 17, 2020, in order to address the need for public meetings 
during the present public health emergency, Governor Newsom issued Executive 
Order No. N-29-20, suspending the Act’s teleconferencing requirements; and 
 

WHEREAS, on June 11, 2021, Governor Newsom issued Executive Order No. N-
08-21, continuing the suspension of the Brown Act’s teleconferencing requirements 
through September 30, 2021; and 
 

WHEREAS, these Executive Orders allowed legislative bodies to meet virtually 
as long as certain notice and accessibility requirements were met; and 
 

WHEREAS, on September 16, 2021, the Governor signed Assembly Bill No. 361  
(A.B. 361 – Government Code section 54953) that went into effect on October 1, 
2021, which amended the Brown Act so that a local agency may use 
teleconferencing without complying with the regular teleconferencing 
requirements of the Act, where the legislative body holds a meeting during a 
proclaimed state of emergency and makes certain findings; and 
 

WHEREAS, Government Code section 54953 requires that the legislative body 
make additional findings every 30 days in order to continue such teleconferencing; 
and 
 

WHEREAS, state and local officials continue to impose and recommend 
measures to promote social distancing, and because of the ongoing threat of 
COVID-19, meeting in person would present imminent risks to the health and safety 
of attendees; and 
 
 

10 of 79



WHEREAS, teleconferencing ensures the health and safety of the public, the 
legislative bodies of the city, and City staff while allowing regularly-scheduled 
meetings to occur without interruption due to COVID-19. 
 
NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Wasco as follows:     
 
SECTION 1: That the foregoing recitals are true and correct and incorporate them 
by this reference. 
 
SECTION 2: That the City Council finds, by a majority vote, the following: 

a. The City Council has reconsidered the circumstances of the state 
of emergency; and 

b. Any of the following circumstances exist: 

1. The state of emergency continues to directly impact the 
ability of the members to meet safely in person. 

2. State or local officials continue to impose or recommend 
measures to promote social distancing. 

3. As a result of the emergency, meeting in person would 
present imminent risks to the health or safety of attendees 

 
SECTION 3: That this Resolution to implement teleconferencing pursuant to 
Government Code section 54953(e) applies to the City Council and all committees, 
commissions, boards, and other City meetings (“other legislative bodies”) of the City 
of Wasco based upon the findings listed above. 

 
SECTION 4:  That the City Manager or the City Manager’s designee is authorized to 
take all steps and perform all actions necessary to execute and implement this 
Resolution in compliance with Government Code section 54953. 

 
SECTION 5: That this Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its adoption and 
remain in effect for 30 days or until such time as the City Council adopts a 
subsequent resolution in accordance with Government Code section 54953(e)(3) to 
extend the time during which the City Council and all other legislative bodies of the 
City of Wasco may continue to teleconference without compliance with 
Government Code section 54953(b)(3). 

 
 

            -o0o- 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

11 of 79



 
I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Resolution No. 2022 -       was passed and adopted by 
the Council of the City of Wasco at a regular meeting thereof held on November 15, 2022,  
by the following vote: 
 

COUNCIL MEMBERS:       
AYES:     
NOES:      
ABSTAIN:    
ABSENT:    

 
 
 
 

 __________________________________ 
 GILBERTO REYNA 

 MAYOR of City the Wasco 
  

Attest: _______________ 
 
 
 
__________________________ 
MARIA O. MARTINEZ 
CITY CLERK and Ex Officio Clerk of  
the Council of the City of Wasco 
 

12 of 79



. 

TO:    Honorable Mayor and Council Members
  
FROM:  M. Scott Hurlbert, City Manager
  Luis Villa, Public Works Director

DATE:    November 15, 2022

SUBJECT:  Adopt a Resolution Authorizing the City Manager or his designee to 
approve a purchase order in an amount not to exceed $110,314.05 for one 
Utility Crane Truck for the Wastewater Department from National Fleet 
Group.

Recommendation:  
Staff recommends City Council adopt a resolution authorizing the City Manager or his 
designee to approve a purchase order in an amount not to exceed $110,314.05 to 
purchase one Utility Crane Truck for the Wastewater Department from National Auto 
Fleet Group. 

Discussion: 
The Wastewater Department currently lacks equipment to support the lifting and 
lowering of equipment in the field such as pumps and collection system 
equipment. This utility crane truck will minimize the need for a crane rental when 
servicing sewer lift station pumps and allow us to respond to emergencies in a 
timely manner. The city received a quote from National Auto Fleet group for a 
2023 Ford F-350 with a Douglass crane body. 

In accordance with the City’s municipal code, the City may utilize joint powers 
agreements, to procure equipment. The City is a member of Sourcewell.  
Sourcewell is a national joint power agreement that allows the City to make 
equipment purchases without further competitive bidding. The City will be 
obtaining the truck using Sourcewell Contract No. 091521-NAF.

Fiscal Impact:  
The City budgeted $95,000 in the 2022-23 budget (Project No. 20231) for this Utility 
crane truck for the Wastewater Department. The cost of this vehicle came in at 
$110,314.05 which is over the budgeted amount for this purchase. A budget 

STAFF REPORT
City of Wasco

.............

13 of 79



transfer from CIP project #23017 in the amount of $15,314.05 is required with this 
action.  
    

 
 
 
Attachments:  

1. Resolution 
2. National Auto Fleet Group Quote 
 

 
 

14 of 79



RESOLUTION NO. 2022 -  
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WASCO AUTHORIZING THE CITY 
MANAGER OR HIS DESIGNEE TO APPROVE A PURCHASE ORDER TO PURCHASE ONE 
UTILITY CRANE TRUCK FOR THE WASTEWATER DEPARTMENT FROM NATIONAL AUTO 

FLEET GROUP IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $110,314.05 
 

 
WHEREAS, the City wishes to purchase a Ford F-350 Utility Crane truck from 

National Auto Fleet Group; and, 
 
WHEREAS, said Agreement has been made in the form and manner 

prescribed by the City of Wasco Municipal Code and the California Public Contract 
Code; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the Agreement shall be governed by and construed in 

accordance with the laws of the State of California; and, 
 

WHEREAS, the City’s cost for the Utility truck in the amount not to exceed 
$110,314.05 is to be from the Wastewater Enterprise Fund; and, 

 
 NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Wasco as 
follows:     
 
SECTION 1:  Authorizes the City Manager or his designee to sign and execute a 
purchase order with National Auto Fleet Group to purchase one Ford F-350 Utility 
crane truck for the Wastewater Department in an amount not to exceed 
$110,314.05.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

-o0o-   
 
 
 
 

15 of 79



I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Resolution No. 2022 -        was passed and adopted by 
the Council of the City of Wasco at a regular meeting thereof held on November 15, 2022, 
by the following vote: 

COUNCIL MEMBERS:        
AYES:   
NOES:   
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:   

 
    
 __________________________ 

 GILBERTO REYNA, 
 MAYOR of the City of Wasco  

 
   Attest: _______________                                                    

 
 
 

 
__________________________________ 
MARIA O. MARTINEZ      
CITY CLERK and Ex Officio Clerk of  
the Council of the City of Wasco 

 

 

16 of 79



17 of 79



18 of 79



19 of 79



20 of 79



21 of 79



22 of 79



23 of 79



24 of 79



25 of 79



26 of 79



27 of 79



28 of 79



29 of 79



30 of 79



31 of 79



. 

TO:    Honorable Mayor and Council Members
  
FROM:  M. Scott Hurlbert, City Manager
  Luis Villa, Public Works Director

DATE:    November 15, 2022

SUBJECT:  Adopt a Resolution Authorizing the City Manager or his designee to 
approve a purchase order in an amount not to exceed $110,314.05 for one 
Utility Crane Truck for the Water Department from National Fleet Group.

Recommendation:  
Staff recommends City Council adopt a resolution authorizing the City Manager to 
approve a purchase order in an amount not to exceed $110,314.05 to purchase one 
Utility Crane Truck for the Water Department from National Auto Fleet Group. 

Discussion: 
The Water Department currently has an aging utility crane truck #51 that needs 
replacement. The purchase of this crane will support the lifting and lowering of
equipment in the field such as fire hydrants, gate valves, and larger diameter 
pipes. This utility crane truck will minimize the need for a crane rental when 
performing water distribution system maintenance. The city received a quote 
from National Auto Fleet group for a 2023 Ford F-350 with a Douglass crane body. 
Due to the limited availability of Ford F-350s Ford is not able to guarantee delivery 
of this vehicle. 

In accordance with the City’s municipal code, the City may utilize joint powers 
agreements, to procure equipment. The City is a member of Sourcewell.  
Sourcewell is a national joint power agreement that allows the City to make 
equipment purchases without further competitive bidding. The City will be 
obtaining the truck using Sourcewell Contract No. 091521-NAF.  

Fiscal Impact:  
The City budgeted $162,000 in the 2022-23 budget (Project No. 22025) for this Utility 
crane truck and a smaller utility vehicle for the Water Department. The cost of this 
vehicle came in at $110,314.05 which is well under the remaining budget 
$132,201.63 for this project. 
  

STAFF REPORT
City of Wasco

.............

32 of 79



 
 
 
Attachments:  

1. Resolution 
2. National Auto Fleet Group Quote 
 

 
 

33 of 79



RESOLUTION NO. 2022 -  
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WASCO AUTHORIZING THE CITY 
MANAGER OR HIS DESIGNEE TO APPROVE A PURCHASE ORDER TO PURCHASE ONE 
UTILITY CRANE TRUCK FOR THE WATER DEPARTMENT FROM NATIONAL AUTO FLEET 

GROUP IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $110,314.05 
 

 
WHEREAS, the City wishes to purchase a Ford F-350 Utility Crane truck from 

National Auto Fleet Group; and, 
 
WHEREAS, said Agreement has been made in the form and manner 

prescribed by the City of Wasco Municipal Code and the California Public Contract 
Code; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the Agreement shall be governed by and construed in 

accordance with the laws of the State of California; and, 
 

WHEREAS, the City’s cost for the Utility truck in the amount not to exceed 
$110,314.05 is to be from the Water Enterprise Fund; and, 

 
 NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Wasco as 
follows:     
 
SECTION 1:  Authorizes the City Manager or his designee to sign and execute a 
purchase order with National Auto Fleet Group to purchase one Ford F-350 Utility 
crane truck for the Water Department in an amount not to exceed $110,314.05.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

-o0o-   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

34 of 79



 
   

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Resolution No. 2022 -        was passed and adopted by 
the Council of the City of Wasco at a regular meeting thereof held on November 15, 2022, 
by the following vote: 

COUNCIL MEMBERS:        
AYES:   
NOES:   
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:   

 
    
 __________________________ 

 GILBERTO REYNA, 
 MAYOR of the City of Wasco  

 
   Attest: _______________                                                    

 
 
 

 
__________________________________ 
MARIA O. MARTINEZ      
CITY CLERK and Ex Officio Clerk of  
the Council of the City of Wasco 

 

 

35 of 79



36 of 79



37 of 79



38 of 79



39 of 79



40 of 79



41 of 79



42 of 79



43 of 79



44 of 79



45 of 79



46 of 79



47 of 79



48 of 79



49 of 79



50 of 79



. 

TO:    Honorable Mayor and Council Members
  
FROM:  M. Scott Hurlbert, City Manager
  Luis Villa, Public Works Director

DATE:    November 15, 2022 

SUBJECT:  Adopt a Resolution to approve a Budget Amendment to Re-Allocate Funds 
to Pay Retention for the 2021 Ag Well Project#30400-52040-20220 located 
at SW corner of Scofield & Dirt Poso 1 mile south of Highway 46 . 

Recommendation:  
Staff recommends the City Council to adopt a resolution and approve a budget 
amendment to re-allocate funds to pay retention for the 2021 Ag Well Project. 

Background:
This project was to provide Repair and Installation Services for the City of Wasco’s Ag 
Well located at the SW corner of Scofield & Dirt Poso 1 mile south of Highway 46. On 
November 16, 2021 Council Accepted the Ag Well Drilling Project and Authorization for 
the City Clerk to file the Notice of Completion. The intention and standard procedure 
after acceptance of the Project would be to pay out retention (5% of Project total) 30 
days after Council acceptance. 

At the time of Council acception the Project was complete, but the city did not receive 
any invoice from Bakersfield Well and Pump Co. to pay this retention payment. The Public 
works department believes this invoice may have been sent to previous management 
and was somehow missed.  

Discussion: 
Bakersfield Well and Pump Co. has completed the work outlined in the plans and 
specifications of the Project, the notice of completion has been filed allowing us to pay 
out retention. 

Fiscal Impact:  
The current amount of retention owed to Bakersfield Well and Pump CO. is $17,274.75. 
Re-appropriation in the amount of $17,274.75. into Project Code #30400-52040-20220 is 
required with this transaction.

Attachments: 
1. Resolution

STAFF REPORT
City of Wasco

.............

51 of 79



RESOLUTION NO. 2022 -  
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WASCO APPROVING A BUDGET 
AMENDMENT TO PAY THE AG WELL PROJECT RETENTION 

 
 

WHEREAS, the City wishes to pay out retention to Bakersfield Well and Pump; 
and 
 
WHEREAS, the Ag Well Drilling Project was accepted by Council on November, 
2021 and authorzed the City Clerk to file the notice of completion: and, 
 
WHEREAS, Bakersfield Well and Pump Co. had completed the project and 
allowing the city to pay out the retention payment. 
 

 NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Wasco as 
follows:     
 
SECTION 1:  Approves the budget amendment totaling $17,274.75 to pay out 
retention to Bakersfield well and pump for Ag well project.  
 
 
 
 

-o0o-   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

52 of 79



 
  I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Resolution No. 2022 -        was passed and 
adopted by the Council of the City of Wasco at a regular meeting thereof held on 
November 15, 2022 by the following vote: 

COUNCIL MEMBERS:     
AYES:   
NOES:   
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:   

 
    
 __________________________ 

 GILBERTO REYNA, 
 MAYOR of the City of Wasco  

 
   Attest: _______________                                                    

 
 
 

 
__________________________________ 
MARIA O. MARTINEZ      
CITY CLERK and Ex Officio Clerk of  
the Council of the City of Wasco 

 

 

53 of 79



54 of 79



55 of 79



. 

TO:    Honorable Mayor and Council Members
  
FROM:  M. Scott Hurlbert, City Manager
  Luis Villa, Public Works Director

DATE:    November 15, 2022

SUBJECT:  Adopt a Resolution Authorizing the City Manager or his designee to 
approve a purchase order with Ferguson Waterworks in the amount not to 
exceed $48,000.00 to purchase one hundred and fifty residential water 
meters.  

Recommendation:  
Staff recommends City Council Adopt a Resolution Authorizing the City Manager or his 
designee to approve a purchase order with Ferguson Waterworks in the amount not to 
exceed $48,000.00 to purchase one hundred and fifty residential water meters.

Discussion: 
These residential water meters will be replacing existing water meters that need
replacement. As water meters age, because they are mechanical, they under register and 
don't over register. This greatly affects water loss as we are not accurately billing for the water 
being supplied to residents. This purchase would allow us to replace meters that need
replacement as well as keep an inventory for future replacements. With materials and supply 
shortages it is prudent we keep inventory of these meters. This purchase order request is for 
one-hundred ¾ “ meters and fifty 1” meters. 

The city attempted to collect three quotes from vendors. Ferguson Waterworks came in 
at the lowest price per meter. 

1) Ferguson Waterworks
i) ¾” T10 Neptune Meter: $257.00     
ii) 1”  T10 Neptune Meter: $350.00

2) Core and Main 
i) ¾” Hersey Meter: $267.00
ii) 1”  Hersey Meter: $372.00 

3) Badger 
i) Not able to provide quote 

Due to Materials shortages coupled with shipping and logistics challenges a contingency 
was included of $1,236.00 with this purchase order request. 

STAFF REPORT
City of Wasco

.............

56 of 79



 
Fiscal Impact:   
The City budgeted $80,000.00 in the Water department enterprise fund Account 31400-
505309 for meter replacements. This purchase order request in the amount not to exceed 
$48,000.00.  
 
 
Attachments:  

1. Resolution  
2. Ferguson and Core and Main Quotes  

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

57 of 79



RESOLUTION NO. 2022 -  
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WASCO AUTHORIZING THE 
CITY MANAGER OR HIS DESIGNEE TO APPROVE A PURCHASE ORDER WITH 
FERGUSON WATERWORKS IN THE AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $48,000.00 TO 

PURCHASE ONE-HUNDRED FIFTY RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS.  
 

WHEREAS, the City wishes to purchase a one-hundred fifty residential water 
meters.  
 

WHEREAS, the purchase shall be governed by and construed in 
accordance with the laws of the State of California; and, 
  

WHEREAS, the City’s cost for this purchase will be in an amount not to 
exceed $48,000.00 to be from the Water enterprise fund account #31400-505309; 
and, 
 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Wasco 
as follows:     
 
SECTION 1:  Authorizes the City Manager or his designee to approve a purchase 

order with Ferguson Waterworks in the amount not to exceed 
$48,000.00 to purchase one-hundred and fifty residential water 
meters.  

 
 

-o0o 
 

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Resolution No. 2022 -        was passed and adopted 
by the Council of the City of Wasco at a regular meeting thereof held on November 15, 
2022, by the following vote: 

COUNCIL MEMBERS:       Garcia, Martinez, Pallares, Reyna, Lynch 
AYES:   
NOES:   
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:   

     __________________________ 
 Gilberto Reyna, 
 MAYOR of the City of Wasco  

 
   Attest:    
                                               
__________________________________ 
MARIA O. MARTINEZ      
CITY CLERK and Ex Officio Clerk of  
the Council of the City of Wasco 

58 of 79



FERGUSON WW BAKERSFIELD #2777
2900 FAIRHAVEN DRIVE
BAKERSFIELD, CA 93308-6125

Phone: 661-396-3230
Fax: 661-397-7429

Deliver To:
From: Ryan Madrigal
Comments:

HOW ARE WE DOING?  WE WANT YOUR FEEDBACK!
Scan the QR code or use the link below to 

complete a survey about your bids:
https://survey.medallia.com/?bidsorder&fc=2777&on=435702

16:52:14 NOV 09 2022
FERGUSON WATERWORKS #1423

Price Quotation
Phone: 661-396-3230

Fax: 661-397-7429

Bid No: B471052
Bid Date: 11/09/22
Quoted By: RIM

Cust Phone: 661-758-7200
Terms: NET 10TH PROX

Customer: CITY OF WASCO
764 E STREET
METER SALES ONLY
WASCO, CA 93280

Ship To: CITY OF WASCO
764 E STREET
METER SALES ONLY
WASCO, CA 93280

Cust PO#: Job Name: T10

Page 1 of 1

 Item  Description  Quantity  Net Price  UM  Total 

SP-NED2C21RHF2SG7 3/4 T10 P/C CF 6' NICOR 100 257.000 CF 25700.00
SP-NED2F12RPHF11SG 1 T10 CF P/C 6' NICOR 50 350.000 CF 17500.00

Net Total: $43200.00
Tax: $3564.00

Freight: $0.00
Total: $46764.00

Quoted prices are based upon receipt of the total quantity for immediate shipment (48 hours).  SHIPMENTS BEYOND 48 HOURS SHALL BE
AT THE PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE. QUOTES FOR PRODUCTS SHIPPED FOR RESALE

CONTACT YOUR SALES REPRESENTATIVE IMMEDIATELY FOR ASSISTANCE WITH DBE/MBE/WBE/SMALL BUSINESS REQUIREMENTS.

ARE NOT FIRM UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE.

https://www.ferguson.com/content/website-info/terms-of-sale

LEAD LAW WARNING: It is illegal to install products that are not "lead free" in accordance with US Federal or other applicable law in potable water 
systems anticipated for human consumption. Products with *NP in the description are NOT lead free and can only be installed in non-potable 
applications. Buyer is solely responsible for product selection. 
WATER FLOW RATE NOTICE:  Lavatory Faucets with flow rates over 0.5 GPM are  not allowed for 'public use' in California. 
COVID-19 ORDER: ANY REFERENCE TO OR INCORPORATION OF EXECUTIVE ORDER 14042 AND/OR THE EO-IMPLEMENTING FEDERAL 
CLAUSES (FAR 52.223-99 AND/OR DFARS 252.223-7999) IS EXPRESSLY REJECTED BY SELLER AND SHALL NOT APPLY AS SELLER IS A 
MATERIALS SUPPLIER AND THEREFORE EXEMPT UNDER THE EXECUTIVE ORDER.

Seller not responsible for delays, lack of product or increase of pricing due to causes beyond our control, and/or based upon
Local, State and Federal laws governing type of products that can be sold or put into commerce.  This Quote is offered contingent upon the
Buyer's acceptance of Seller's terms and conditions, which are incorporated by reference and found either following this document, or
on the web at 
Govt Buyers:  All items are open market unless noted otherwise.

59 of 79

350.000
257.000

$46764.00



Seq# Qty Descrip on Units Price Ext Price

DUE TO CURRENT SUPPLY CHAIN DISRUPTIONS, MATERIALS
ARE SUBJECT TO PRICING AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. MATERIAL
AVAILABILITY AND TIMELINESS OF SHIPMENTS CANNOT BE

GUARANTEED. THIS TERM SUPERSEDES ALL OTHER
CONTRACTUAL PROVISIONS.

10 150 HERSEY 435 3/4X7-1/2 VELB123N EA 267.00 40,050.00
20 50 HERSEY 1" VEKB123N CU FT EA 372.00 18,600.00
30 13 WEEKS LEAD TIME ARO

Sub Total 58,650.00
Tax 4,838.63

Total 63,488.63

UNLESS OTHERWISE SPECIFIED HEREIN, PRICES QUOTED ARE VALID IF ACCEPTED BY CUSTOMER AND PRODUCTS ARE RELEASED BY
CUSTOMER FOR MANUFACTURE WITHIN THIRTY (30) CALENDAR DAYS FROM THE DATE OF THIS QUOTATION. CORE & MAIN LP
RESERVES THE RIGHT TO INCREASE PRICES TO ADDRESS FACTORS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO, GOVERNMENT REGULATIONS,
TARIFFS, TRANSPORTATION, FUEL AND RAW MATERIAL COSTS. DELIVERY WILL COMMENCE BASED UPON MANUFACTURER LEAD
TIMES. ANY MATERIAL DELIVERIES DELAYED BEYOND MANUFACTURER LEAD TIMES MAY BE SUBJECT TO PRICE INCREASES AND/OR
APPLICABLE STORAGE FEES. THIS BID PROPOSAL IS CONTINGENT UPON BUYER’S ACCEPTANCE OF SELLER’S TERMS AND
CONDITIONS OF SALE, AS MODIFIED FROM TIME TO TIME, WHICH CAN BE FOUND AT: h ps://coreandmain.com/TandC/

11/08/2022 - 9:33 AM Actual taxes may vary Page 2 of 2

CITY OF WASCO
Bid Date: 11/08/2022
Core & Main 2622301

Core & Main
4920 Lisa Marie Ct

Bakersfield, CA 93313
Phone: 661-834-1162

Bid Proposal for HERSEY METERS

60 of 79

267.00
372.00



  
 

STAFF REPORT 
 

CITY OF WASCO 
 

TO:    Honorable Mayor and Council Members 
 
FROM:   M. Scott Hurlbert, City Manager 
  Luis Villa, Public Works Director 
  
DATE:    November 15, 2022  
 
SUBJECT:     Rejection of all bids received for 16th Street Rehabilitation Project. 
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
Recommendation:   
Staff recommends the City Council rejects all bids received for 16th Street Rehabilitation 
Project. 
 
Discussion: 
A Request for Proposal was published on June 26, 2022. The notice to bidders requesting 
the rehabilitation of 16th Street between Hwy. 43 and Griffith Ave. The project would 
involve grinding and repaving of 3” of existing asphalt, removal and replacement of 
curb & gutter, cross gutters, ADA ramps, and striping.  
  
On September 8, 2022 the City of Wasco received 3 bids from the following contractors: 
 
   FIRM        BID TOTAL 
 
Grifftih Company                $ 467,735.00 
Bowman Asphalt, Inc.  $ 368,140.00 
Cen-Cal Construction  $ 457,557.00 
 
After City staff reviewed the bids, documents were sent to the County for their review. 
Once the County reviewed, they determined a section of the documents in the bids 
that they provided to the City were not up-to-date and rejected all bids. The County 
did not allow for current bidders to update the documents and recommended City re-
bid the project. 
 
Staff recommends the City Council reject all received bids as determined by County. 
Once rejected, Staff will proceed with re-bidding the project.   
 
Fiscal Impact: 
None at this time.  
 
Attachments: 

1. Bid Summary 

61 of 79



. 

TO:    Honorable Mayor and Council Members
  
FROM:  M. Scott Hurlbert, City Manager

Keri Cobb, Community Development Director
Tom Schroeter, City Attorney

DATE:    November 15, 2022

SUBJECT:  Introduce and Waive the First Reading of an Ordinance of the City Council 
of the City of Wasco Repealing and Re-enacting Chapter 15.04 of the City 
of Wasco Municipal Code Relating to Building Code Regulations, and 
Adopting by Reference the California Code of Regulations Title 24, Parts 1-
6 and 8-12, 2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code.

Recommendation:  
Staff recommends that the City Council introduce and waive the first reading of an 
Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Wasco Repealing and Re-enacting Chapter 
15.04 of the City of Wasco Municipal Code Relating to Building Code Regulations, and 
Adopting by Reference the California Code of Regulations Title 24, Parts 1-6 and 8-12, 
2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code. 

Discussion: 
Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 18938 (c), the California Building Standards 
Commission updates State building code standards every three years, and cities and 
counties must re-adopt their local building codes to be consistent with the State 
standards. The 2022 edition of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Parts 1-12 is 
now available for local adoption, to become effective January 1, 2023. 

Chapter 15.04 of the Wasco Municipal Code contains the City’s building code standards 
and indicates which of the State building codes are adopted by the City. As indicated 
in the ordinance amendment, the adoption of this ordinance will adopt Parts 1-6 and 8-
12 of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24 by reference. The updated codes will 
become effective January 1, 2023 and will apply for the next three years until Title 24 of 
the California Code of Regulations is again updated.

Fiscal Impact:  
Monies for the purchase of new code books were budgeted in the 2022/2023 City of
Wasco Annual Budget and electronic and hard copy versions of the 2022 code have 
been purchased.

STAFF REPORT
City of Wasco

.............

62 of 79



 
Attachments:  

1. Re-enacted Chapter 15.04, Wasco Building Code, First Reading 
 

63 of 79



 

ORDINANCE NO. 2022 -    

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WASCO REPEALING AND RE-
ENACTING CHAPTER 15.04 OF THE CITY OF WASCO MUNICIPAL CODE RELATING TO 

BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS, AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE CALIFORNIA 
CODE OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24, 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS 

CODE INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING PARTS: 
 

  
Part 1 California Administrative Code 
Part 2 California Building Code 
Part 2.5 California Residential Code 
Part 3 California Electrical Code 
Part 4 California Mechanical Code 
Part 5 California Plumbing Code 
Part 6 California Energy Code 
Part 7 (Currently Vacant) 
Part 8 California Historical Code 
Part 9 California Fire Code 
Part 10 California Existing Building Code 
Part 11 California Green Building Standards Code 
Part 12 California Referenced Standards Code 

 

The City Council of the City of Wasco does ordain as follows: 

 
Section 1: Repeal 
Chapter 15.04 of the Wasco Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety. 
 
Section 2: Purpose and Authority 
The purpose of this Ordinance is to adopt by reference the 2022 edition of the California 
Building Standards Code, Title 24 of the California Code of regulations, subject to the 
definitions, clarifications, and amendments set forth in this Ordinance. The purpose of this 
Ordinance is also to provide minimum requirements and standards for the protection of the 
public safety, health, property and welfare of the City of Wasco. This Ordinance is adopted 
under the authority of Government Code Subsection 50022.2 and Health and Safety Code 
Section 18941.5. 
 
Section 3: Reenacted 
Chapter 15.04 of the Wasco Municipal Code, Wasco Building Code, is hereby reenacted 
and adopted to read as follows: 
 
 
 

64 of 79



15.04.010  Title. 
This chapter shall be known as the Wasco Building Code, and may be cited as 
such, and will be referred to herein as "this code." 
 
15.04.015  Application. 
This code shall be the exclusive source of regulations for all new construction and 
any alterations, repairs, relocations, or reconstruction of any building or any 
portion thereof including any electrical, mechanical, gas, plumbing, or fire 
protection equipment installed on any property or used on or within any building. 
 
15.04.020  Conflicts with other laws, rules, etc. 
In the event of any conflict between this code and any law, rule, or regulation of 
the state of California, that requirement which establishes the higher standard of 
safety shall govern. Failure to comply with such standard of safety shall be a 
violation of this code. 
 
15.04.025  Fees. 
A.  Notwithstanding any provisions in the codes adopted by reference in this 
chapter, all fees related to said codes are to be set by resolution by the city 
council. 

B.  Fees for duplicating documents and other special services shall be set and 
established by the administrative authority. 
 
15.04.030  Adoption of Uniform Codes. 
The following publications are adopted by reference and incorporated in this 
code, except as expressly amended or superseded by the provisions of this 
chapter: 
 
A.  Part 1, California Administrative Code, 2022 Edition; 

B.  Part 2, California Building Code, 2022 Edition; 

C.  Part 2.5, California Residential Building Code, 2022 Edition; 

D.  Part 3, California Electrical Code, 2022 Edition; 

E.  Part 4, California Mechanical Code, 2022 Edition; 

F.  Part 5, California Plumbing Code, 2022 Edition; 

G.  Part 6, California Energy Code, 2022 Edition; 

H.  Part 8, California Historical Code, 2022 Edition; 

I.  Part 9, California Fire Code, 2022 Edition; 

J.  Part 10, California Existing Building Code, 2022 Edition; 

K.  Part 11, California Green Building Standards Code, 2022 Edition; 

65 of 79



L.  Part 12, California Referenced Standards Code, 2022 Edition; 

M.  Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition, as published by the International 
Conference of Building Officials 
 
15.04.035 California Building Code amendments. 
These are the amendments due to climatic, geological, and topographical 
findings. These amendments are more restrictive than the model code. 

This chapter contains the local amendments and clarifications to the technical 
requirements of the 2022 California Building Code. Most proposed changes result 
in regulations consistent with the city’s current building code and are also 
consistent with the fire code in Chapter 15.06. 

Section 105.2 amended – Work exempt from permit. 

 Section 105.2 items 1 and 2 amended to read as follows: 

1. One-story residential detached accessory structures used as tool 
and storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided that the 
floor area does not exceed 120 square feet (11.15 mm2). It is 
permissible that these structures still be regulated by Section 710A, 
despite exemption from permit. 

2. Residential fences not over 7 feet (2134 mm) high, not including 
masonry block wall fences. 

Section 110.3.6 amended – Lath, gypsum board and gypsum panel product 
inspection. 

Section 110.3.6 is amended by omitting the exception. 

Section 406.3.2.1 amended – Dwelling unit separation. 

Section 406.3.2.1 is amended to read as follows: 

406.3.2.1 Dwelling unit separation. The private garage shall be separated 
from the dwelling unit and its attic area by means of a minimum 5/8-inch 
Type X (15.9 mm) gypsum board applied to the garage side. Garages 
beneath habitable rooms shall be separated from all habitable rooms 
above by not less than a 5/8-inch (15.9 mm) Type X gypsum board or 
equivalent and the same applied to structures supporting the separation 
from the habitable rooms above the garage.  

Section 903.2.1 amended – Group A. 

Section 903.2.1 is amended to read as follows: 

903.2.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout buildings and portions thereof used as Group A occupancies 
as provided in this section. For Group A-1, A-2, A-3, and A-4 occupancies, 
the automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the entire 

66 of 79



building containing a Group A-1, A-2, A-3 or A-4 occupancy. For Group A-
5 occupancies, the automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in the 
spaces indicated in Section 903.2.1.5. 

Section 903.2.1.1 amended - Groups A-1, A-3, and A-4. 

Section 903.2.1.1 is amended to read as follows 

903.2.1.1 Groups A-1, A-3 and A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided for Group A-1, A-3 and A-4 occupancies. 

EXCEPTIONS: 

1. Assembly rooms or spaces with a cumulative area less than 1,000 
square feet (93 m2) and located on a level of exit discharge where 
no alcohol is consumed and a fire alarm is installed when required 
by Section 907.2.1. 

2. A Group A-3 occupancy with a fire area that does not exceed 
5,000 square feet (464.5 m2), an occupant load less than 100, the 
A-3 is located on the level of exit discharge and the building 
contains a fire alarm as required by Section 907.2.1. 

Section 903.2.1.3 deleted – Group A-3. 

Section 903.2.1.3 is deleted. 

Section 903.2.1.4 deleted – Group A-4. 

Section 903.2.1.4 is deleted. 

Section 903.2.2.1 added – Group B. 

Section 903.2.2.1 is added to read as follows: 

903.2.2.1 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout buildings containing a Group B occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. A Group B fire area exceeds 10,000 square feet (929 m2); 
2. A Group B fire area is located more than three stories above grade 

plane; or 
3. The combined area of all Group B fire areas on all floors, including 

any mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2). 

Section 903.2.3 amended – Group E. 

Section 903.2.3, Item 1 is amended to read as follows: 

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 10,000 square feet 
(929 m2) in area. 

Section 903.2.4 amended – Group F. 

67 of 79



Section 903.2.4 is amended to read as follows: 

903.2.4 Group F. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout all buildings containing a Group F occupancy where one of 
the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group F fire area exceeds 10,000 square feet (929 m2); 
2. A Group F fire area is located more than three stories above grade 

plane; or 
3. The combined area of all Group F fire areas on all floors, including 

any mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2). 
4. A Group F fire area is used for cannabis cultivation, processing or 

extraction. 

Section 903.2.7 amended – Group M. 

Section 903.2.7, Item 1 is amended to read as follows:  

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 10,000 square feet (929 m2). 
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above 

grade plane. 
3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including 

any mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2). 
4. A Group M fire area is used for retail of cannabis or cannabis 

products. 

Section 903.2.8.5 added – Manufactured Homes. 

Section 903.2.8.5 is added to Chapter 9 of the Kern County Fire Code to 
read as follows: 

903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
installed in new manufactured homes, as defined in Health and Safety 
Code Sections 18007 & 18009, and multiple family manufactured homes 
with two dwelling units, as defined in Health and Safety Code Section 
18008.7, in accordance with Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations. 

Section 903.2.9 amended – Group S-1. 

Section 903.2.9, Item 1 is amended to read as follows: 

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 10,000 square feet (929 m2); 

Section 903.2.9.1 amend repair garages. 

Section 903.2.9.1 is amended to read as follows: 

903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout all buildings used as repair garages in accordance with the 
Kern County Building Code, as follows: 

68 of 79



1. Buildings with a fire area containing a repair garage exceeding 
10,000 square feet (929 m2). 

2. Buildings with a repair garage servicing vehicles parked in the 
basement. 

3. A Group S-1 fire area used for the repair of commercial motor 
vehicles where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2). 

Section 903.2.10 amended – Group S-2. 

Section 903.2.10 is amended to read as follows: 

903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout buildings classified as a Group S-2 occupancy where one of 
the following conditions exist:  

1. A Group S-2 fire area exceeds 10,000 square feet (929 m2). 
2. Where an enclosed parking garage is located beneath other 

occupancy groups. 
3. The combined area of all Group S-2 fire areas on all floors, including 

any mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2). 

Section 903.2.11.3 amended  –  Multi-story buildings and buildings 55 feet or more 
in height. 

Section 903.2.11.3 is amended to read as follows: 

903.2.11.3 Multi-story buildings and buildings 55 feet or more in height. An 
automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout buildings more 
than 3 stories in height or with a floor level having an occupant load of 30 
or more that is located 55 feet (16,764 mm) or more above the lowest 
level of fire department vehicle access. 

Section 903.3.1.2.3 amended – Attics. 

Section 903.3.1.2.3, Item 3 is amended to read as follows: 

3.      Attics not required by Items 1 or 2 to have sprinklers shall comply with 
one of the following if the building is more than two stories in height: 

3.1 Provide automatic sprinkler system protection. 
3.2 Construct the attic using noncombustible materials. 
3.3 Construct the attic using fire-retardant-treated wood complying 

with Section 2303.2 of the International Building Code. 
3.4 Fill the attic with noncombustible insulation. 

Section 903.3.10 added – Fire sprinkler control room. 

Section 903.3.10 is added to read as follows: 

903.3.10 Fire sprinkler control room. When an automatic fire sprinkler 
system is installed in a building constructed for multiple tenants and the 

69 of 79



system protects multiple tenant spaces, the main controls, risers, gauges 
and appurtenances shall be located in an attached room or enclosure 
with access only from an exterior door which has a minimum size of 3’-0” 
wide and 6’-8” high. The equipment required to be in the fire sprinkler 
control room shall be located in the fire alarm control room when one is 
required in accordance with Section 907.9. 

Section 903.6 added – Existing buildings. 

Section 903.6 is added to read as follows: 

903.6 Existing buildings. In other than Group U occupancies, when the 
floor area of an existing building is increased and the total floor area 
exceeds ten thousand (10,000) square feet (929 m2) before or after the 
addition, or is otherwise required to be equipped with an automatic 
sprinkler system in accordance with this code, an automatic sprinkler 
system shall be installed throughout the entire building. 

EXCEPTIONS: 

1. If new or existing fire areas are clearly established within the limits of 
this code and approved by the Fire and Building Official. 

2. Where a fire wall of 4 hour fire- resistance-rated construction 
without openings is installed to separate the new and existing 
portions of the building, only the new portion need comply. 

Section 905.5.3 deleted – Class II system 1-inch hose. 

Section 905.5.3 is deleted. 

Section 907.2.1 amended – Group A. 

Section 907.2.1 first paragraph is amended to read as follows: 

907.2.1 Group A. A manual alarm system that activates the occupant 
notification system in accordance with 907.5 shall be installed in all Group 
A occupancies. 

The Exception is deleted. 

Section 907.2.8.1 amended – Manual fire alarm systems. 

Section 907.2.8.1 is amended by deleting Exception 2. 

Section 907.2.9.1 amended – Manual Fire Alarm Systems. 

Section 907.2.9.1 is amended by deleting Exception 2. 

Section 907.9 added – Fire alarm control room. 

Section 907.9 is added to read as follows: 

70 of 79



907.9 Fire alarm control room. When a fire alarm system is installed in a 
building constructed for multiple tenants and the system protects multiple 
tenant spaces, the fire alarm control panel and appurtenances shall be 
located in an attached room or enclosure with access only from an 
exterior door which has a minimum size of 3’-0” wide and 6’-8” high. The 
equipment required to be in the fire alarm control room shall be located 
in the fire sprinkler control room when one is required in accordance with 
Section 903.3.10. 

Section 1607.1 amended – Minimum Uniformly Distributed Live Loads and 
Minimum Concentrated Live Loads. 

Table 1607.1, Line 4 of item 26 is amended to read as follows: 

Habitable attics and sleeping rooms – 40 psf 
The remainder of item 26 of this table remains unchanged. 

 
15.04.040 California Residential Code amendments. 
These are the amendments due to climatic, geological, and topographical 
findings. These amendments are more restrictive than the model code. 

Table R301.5 amended – Minimum Uniformly Distributed Live Loads 

Table R301.5 is amended as follows: 

The required live load for “Sleeping areas” is amended to 40 pounds per 
square foot (psf) uniform load. The remainder of Table R301.5 remains 
unchanged. 

Section R313.2 amended – One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler 
systems. 

Item No. 1 of Section R313.2 is amended to read as follows: 

1. An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required for 
additions or alterations to existing one- and two-family dwellings that 
are not already provided with an automatic residential sprinkler system 
unless the alteration involves reconstruction of 90% or more of the 
structure above the slab/foundation. Any existing structure that is 
being converted to a one- or two- family dwelling for the first time is 
considered a new dwelling. 

Section 406.3.2.1 amended – Dwelling unit separation. 

Section 406.3.2.1 is amended to read as follows: 

406.3.2.1 Dwelling unit separation. The private garage shall be separated 
from the dwelling unit and its attic area by means of a minimum 5/8-inch 
Type X (15.9 mm) gypsum board applied to the garage side. Garages 
beneath habitable rooms shall be separated from all habitable rooms 

71 of 79



above by not less than a 5/8-inch (15.9 mm) Type X gypsum board or 
equivalent and the same applied to structures supporting the separation 
from the habitable rooms above the garage.  

Section R401.1 amended – Application. 

Section R401.1 shall be amended by replacing the last sentence of the 
first paragraph and all of the listed exceptions with the following: 

Wood foundations shall not be permitted. 

EXCEPTIONS: 

1. Non-occupied, single story, detached wood or metal storage 
sheds and similar uses other than a garage or carport, may be 
supported on skids provided the skids are anchored to the surface, 
the building width does not exceed 14 feet, the building length 
does not exceed 40 feet, the plate height does not exceed 12 feet 
above grade at any point, and the maximum roof projection does 
not exceed 24 inches. 

2. At the discretion of the building official, pressure treated wood 
posts or poles embedded in earth or in concrete footings may be 
used for minor accessory buildings, typically limited to 200 square 
feet, and nonbuilding structures. 

15.04.045  California Electric Code amendments. 
This amendment is due to geological findings.  

Section 250-50 amended – Grounding electrode system. 
Subsection 250-50 is amended by adding the following sentence: 

 
On new construction, where reinforced concrete footings are placed, a 
grounding electrode complying with Article 250.52 (A)(3) shall be installed. 

 
15.04.050  Findings. 
The city council of the city of Wasco finds and declares that the additions, 
modifications, and changes made to the codes are necessary for the protection 
of the public health, safety, and welfare due to climatic, geological, or 
topographical conditions. These amendments are authorized under Health and 
Safety Code Sections 18941.5 and 17958 and are identified as follows: 

A.  Express Finding Number 1:  Climatic.  

1.  The city of Wasco is in the seventy miles per hour wind zone; this results in 
frequent movement and shifting of buildings, structures, and associated 
systems serving those facilities. 
2.  The city of Wasco receives an average rainfall of seven or more inches 
per year. Heavy storms are very infrequent and precipitation events from a 
given storm are typically minimal. 

72 of 79



3.  The city of Wasco is susceptible to extended periods of Tule fog. These 
conditions cause loss of visibility. This condition often results in multiple 
vehicle accidents which will commit emergency resources for extended 
periods of time, as well as create driving difficulties for emergency 
equipment resulting in delayed response times to fires and other 
emergencies. 

B.  Express Finding Number 2:  Geological.  

1.  The city is located in seismic zone 4. Built-in fire protection and other 
safety measures, such as limitations of building height, stories, areas, and 
the anchoring of the structure to the foundation would provide a higher 
level of safety for building occupants, emergency responders, and 
property. This is even more critical in high occupancy (assembly) buildings 
where the potential loss of life is very high. Minor earthquakes occur causing 
movement and shifting of buildings, structures, and associated systems 
serving those facilities. 

C.  Express Finding Number 3:  Topographical.  

1.  The city of Wasco drops in elevation +/- 50 feet from the east to the 
northwest of the natural flow of the land. 

 
15.04.055  Filing of findings. 
The city clerk is directed to file a copy of the ordinance codified in this chapter 
with the California Building Standards Commission of the state of California. 
 
15.04.060  Interpretation. 
The provisions of this code are enacted for the public health, safety, and welfare 
and are to be liberally construed to obtain the beneficial purposes thereof as 
specified in Chapter 1 of the Building Code. 
 
15.04.065  Liability. 
The provisions of this code shall not be construed as imposing upon the City of 
Wasco any liability or responsibility for damage to persons or property resulting 
from defective work, nor shall the city of Wasco, or any official, employee or 
agent thereof, be held as assuming any such liability or responsibility by reason of 
the review or inspection authorized by the provisions of this code or of any 
permits or certificates issued under this code. 
 

Section 4:  Effective date and publication 
The ordinance codified in this chapter shall take effect on January 1, 2023, after its 
adoption and pursuant to resolution, published in summary format prior to adoption 
and within fifteen days after its adoption in a newspaper of general circulation 
published and circulated in the city of Wasco. 
 

73 of 79



The City Clerk is hereby ordered to publish this Ordinance in summary form in 
accordance with the law, in a newspaper of general circulation in the City. This 
ordinance shall become effective 30 days from the date of its adoption. 

 

  -o0o- 

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Wasco on the 15th day 
of November 2022. 

 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Wasco on the 
day 6th of December, 2022, by the following votes: 

  

COUNCIL MEMBERS:          
AYES:   
NOES:   
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:   

 
    
 __________________________ 

 GILBERTO REYNA, 
 MAYOR of the City of Wasco  

 
   Attest: _______________                                                    

 
 
 

 
__________________________________ 
MARIA O. MARTINEZ      
CITY CLERK and Ex Officio Clerk of  
the Council of the City of Wasco 

 

74 of 79



. 

TO:    Honorable Mayor and Council Members
  
FROM:  M. Scott Hurlbert, City Manager

Keri Cobb, Community Development Director
Tom Schroeter, City Attorney
Martin Ledezma, Chief Building Official

DATE:    November 15, 2022

SUBJECT:  Introduce and waive the first reading of an Ordinance of the City Council 
of the City of Wasco Repealing and Re-enacting Chapter 15.08 of the City 
of Wasco Municipal Code Relating to Fire Prevention Regulations, and 
Adopting by Reference the California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 9, 
2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code. 

Recommendation:  
Staff recommends that the City Council introduce and waive the first reading of an 
Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Wasco Repealing and Re-enacting Chapter 
15.08 of the City of Wasco Municipal Code Relating to Fire Prevention Regulations, and 
Adopting by Reference the California Code of Regulations Title 24, Parts 9, 2022 Edition 
of the California Building Standards Code. 

Discussion: 
Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 18938 (c), the California Building Standards 
Commission updates State building code standards every three years, and cities and 
counties must re-adopt their local building codes to be consistent with the State 
standards. The 2022 edition of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Parts 1-12 is 
now available for local adoption, to become effective January 1, 2023. 

Chapter 15.08 of the Wasco Municipal Code contains the City’s fire prevention standards 
and indicates which of the State building fire codes are adopted by the City. As 
indicated in the ordinance amendment, the adoption of this ordinance will adopt Part 9 
of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24 by reference and as modified and 
amended by Chapter 17.32 Fire Code of the Ordinance Code of the County of Kern. The 
updated codes will become effective January 1, 2023 and will apply for the next three 
years until Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations is again updated.

STAFF REPORT
City of Wasco

.............

75 of 79



Fiscal Impact:   
Monies for the purchase of new code books were budgeted in the 2022/2023 City of 
Wasco Annual Budget and electronic and hard copy versions of the 2022 code have 
been purchased. 
 
 
Attachments:  

1. Re-enacted Chapter 15.08, Fire Prevention Code, First Reading 
 

76 of 79



 

ORDINANCE NO. 2022 -    

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WASCO REPEALING AND RE-

ENACTING CHAPTER 15.08 OF THE CITY OF WASCO MUNICIPAL CODE RELATING TO FIRE 
PREVENTION REGULATIONS, AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE CALIFORNIA CODE OF 

REGULATIONS TITLE 24, PART 9, 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS 
CODE 

The City Council of the City of Wasco does ordain as follows: 

 
Section 1: Repeal 
Chapter 15.08 of the Wasco Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety. 
 
Section 2: Purpose and Authority 
The purpose of this Ordinance is to adopt by reference the 2022 edition of the 
California Building Standards Code, Title 24, Part 9 of the California Code of regulations, 
subject to the definitions, clarifications, and amendments set forth in this Ordinance. The 
purpose of this Ordinance is also to provide minimum requirements and standards for 
the protection of the public safety, health, property and welfare of the City of Wasco. 
Chapter 15.08 amendments also keep the City consistent with the Kern County Fire 
Department from which the City contracts services. This Ordinance is adopted under 
the authority of Government Code Subsection 50022.2 and Health and Safety Code 
Section 18941.5. 
 
Section 3: Reenacted 
Chapter 15.08 of the Wasco Municipal Code, Wasco Fire Prevention Code, is hereby 
reenacted and adopted to read as follows: 
 

15.08.010  California Fire Code adopted. 
That portion of the 2022 California Building Standards Code that imposes 
substantially the same requirements as are contained in the International Fire 
Code, 2021 Edition, published by the International Code Council and the 
California Building Standards Commission with errata, together with those 
portions of the International Fire Code, 2021 Edition, including Appendices B, C, 
D and H, published by the International Code Council not included in the 
California Fire Code, as modified and amended by Chapter 17.32 Fire Code, 
Title 17 of the Ordinance Code of the County of Kern and this chapter, are 
collectively declared to be the Fire Code of the City of Wasco. 
 
15.08.020  Development standards. 
Any reference to the Kern County development standards in Chapter 17.32 of 
the Kern County ordinance code shall mean the city of Wasco development 
standards. 
 

77 of 79



15.08.030  Reference to City of Wasco. 
Any reference to the unincorporated area of the county of Kern in Chapter 17.32 
of the Kern County ordinance code shall mean the incorporated area of the city 
of Wasco. 
 
15.08.040  Board of appeals. 
Section 17.32.024 of the Kern County ordinance code is amended to read as 
follows: 
 

109.1 Board of appeals. 
Any authority of the Fire Chief involving discretion, or interpretation of this 
Code, shall be exercised in a reasonable manner. Any decision of the 
Chief relating to the interpretation of this Code, or to the standards 
referred to hereinabove, shall be subject to appeal to the Board of 
Building Appeals. Any decision of the Board of Building Appeals shall be 
subject to appeal to the Wasco City Council. 

 
15.08.050  Violation penalties. 

A. Except as provided herein, any person who shall violate a provision of this 
code or who shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or 
fail to comply with any order made thereunder by competent authority, 
or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work which deviates from any 
specifications or plans submitted to and approved by the Fire Marshal, or 
of a permit or certificate issued under provisions of this code shall for each 
and every such violation or failure to comply be guilty of a misdemeanor 
and shall, upon conviction, be subject to a fine of not more than $1,000 or 
imprisonment in the county jail of the County of Kern for not more than six 
months, or both such fine and imprisonment. 

B. Any person who violates Sections 3308 or 3309 of the Fire Code shall be 
assessed an administrative penalty. An administrative penalty under this 
paragraph shall be a fine not exceeding one thousand five hundred 
dollars ($1,500.00) for the first violation; a fine not exceeding two thousand 
dollars ($2,000.00) for a second violation within five years from the date of 
the first violation; and a fine not exceeding two thousand five hundred 
dollars ($2,500.00) for each additional violation within five years from the 
date of the first violation. 

C. The administrative penalty for any violation of any other section of this 
code shall be as provided in Kern County Ordinance Code Section 
8.54.120. 

D. All enforcement of administrative penalties shall be conducted pursuant 
to Chapter 8.54 of the Kern County Ordinance Code. 
 

E. A conviction for any offense under the provisions of this code shall not 
excuse the violation or authorize its continuance and the person or 
persons convicted of such offense shall be required to correct or remedy 
any condition or installation which fails to comply with the requirements of 
this code with reasonable diligence. Each day that a condition prohibited 

78 of 79



by the provisions of this code is caused or permitted to be maintained or 
continued shall constitute a separate and distinct offense. 

15.08.070  Effective date and publication. 
The ordinance codified in this chapter shall take effect on January 1, 2023, after 
its adoption and pursuant to resolution, published in summary format prior to 
adoption and within fifteen days after its adoption in a newspaper of general 
circulation published and circulated in the city of Wasco. 
 
The City Clerk is hereby ordered to publish this Ordinance in summary form in 
accordance with the law, in a newspaper of general circulation in the City. This 
ordinance shall become effective 30 days from the date of its adoption. 

 
Section 4: Effective date and publication 
The City Clerk is hereby ordered to publish this ordinance in summary form in 
accordance with the law, in a newspaper of general circulation in the City. This 
ordinance shall become effective 30 days from the date of its adoption. 
 

  -o0o- 

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Wasco on the 15th day 
of November 2022. 

 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Wasco on the 
day 6th of December, 2022, by the following votes: 

  

COUNCIL MEMBERS:          
AYES:   
NOES:   
ABSTAIN:  
ABSENT:   

 
    
 __________________________
 GILBERTO REYNA, 

 MAYOR of the City of Wasco  
 

  Attest: _______________                                                    
 
 
 

 
__________________________________ 
MARIA O. MARTINEZ      
CITY CLERK and Ex Officio Clerk of  
the Council of the City of Wasco 

79 of 79


